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WHAT IS THY BELOVED MORE THAN ANOTHER?  7 

 
COLOSSIANS 1:15 
15    Who is the image of the invisible God, the firstborn of every 
creature: 
 
COLOSSIANS 1:16 
16    For by him were all things created, that are in heaven, and 
that are in earth, visible and invisible, whether they be thrones, 
or dominions, or principalities, or powers: all things were created 
by him, and for him: 
 
COLOSSIANS 1:17 
17    And he is before all things, and by him all things consist. 
 
REVELATION 4:11 
11    Thou art worthy, O Lord, to receive glory and honour and 
power: for thou hast created all things, and for thy pleasure they 
are and were created. 
 
JOB 38:29 
29    Out of whose womb came the ice? and the hoary frost of 
heaven, who hath gendered it? 
 
PSALM 147:17 
17    He casteth forth his ice like morsels: who can stand before 
his cold? 
 

Ice crystals are solid ice exhibiting atomic ordering on various 
length scales and include hexagonal columns, hexagonal 
plates, dendritic crystals, and diamond dust. 

 

The hugely symmetric shapes are due to depositional growth, 
namely, direct deposition of water vapour onto the ice crystal. 

 

https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Crystal_growth
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Depending on environmental temperature and humidity, ice 

crystals can develop from the initial hexagonal prism into 
numerous symmetric shapes. 

 

Possible shapes for ice crystals are columns, needles, plates and 
dendrites. 

 

If the crystal migrates into regions with different environmental 
conditions, the growth pattern may change, and the final crystal 

may show mixed patterns. 

 

Ice crystals tend to fall with their major axis aligned along the 
horizontal, and are thus visible in polarimetric weather radar 
signatures with enhanced (positive) differential reflectivity values. 

 

Ice clouds are composed of ice crystals, the most notable 
being cirrus clouds and ice fog. 

 

At ambient temperature and pressure, water molecules have a V 
shape.   The two hydrogen atoms bond to the oxygen atom at a 
105° angle. 
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Common ice crystals are symmetrical and have a hexagonal 
pattern. 

 
JOB 38:29 
29    Out of whose womb came the ice? and the hoary frost of 
heaven, who hath gendered it? 
 
JOB 37:10 
10    By the breath of God frost is given: and the breadth of the 
waters is straitened. 
 
PSALM 147:16 
16    He giveth snow like wool: he scattereth the hoarfrost like 
ashes. 
 
According to the National Weather Service, the Old English 
dictionary (c.   1290) defines hoarfrost as "expressing the 
resemblance of white feathers of frost to an old man's beard.” 
 

https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/File:Hexagonal.svg
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First, to produce any frost, you need water vapor (gaseous form 

of water) in the air over cold ground with a surface dew point at 
least as cold as 32 degrees. 
 
When these water vapor molecules contact a subfreezing surface, 
such as a blade of grass, they jump directly from the gas state to 
solid state, a process known as "deposition", leading to a coating 
of tiny ice crystals. 
 
So what provides the boost for frost to grow into hoarfrost like 
this? 
 
Generally speaking, you want a much more moist air mass in 
place.   In late fall, winter or early spring, one or more days in a 
row of freezing fog (fog with air temperatures of 32 degrees or 
colder) is a perfect scenario. 
 
With more moisture in the air, the interlocking crystal patterns of 
frost become more intricate and much larger, building up to a 
greater depth on tree branches, signs, fences, anything.   This is 
hoarfrost. 
 
If there is a light wind, the hoarfrost can accumulate on the 
downwind side of objects. 
 
JOB 38:30 
30    The waters are hid as with a stone, and the face of the deep 
is frozen. 

in the year 763 the seas at Constantinople were frozen one 
hundred miles from the shore, so thick as to bear the heaviest 
carriages. 

JOB 38:31 
31    Canst thou bind the sweet influences of Pleiades, or loose 
the bands of Orion? 
 
GENESIS 2:4 



5 
 

4        These are the generations of the heavens and of the earth 

when they were created, in the day that the LORD God made the 
earth and the heavens, 
 
I CHRONICLES 16:26 
26    For all the gods of the people are idols: but the LORD made 
the heavens. 
 
NEHEMIAH 9:6 
6    Thou, even thou, art LORD alone; thou hast made heaven, 
the heaven of heavens, with all their host, the earth, and all 
things that are therein, the seas, and all that is therein, and thou 
preservest them all; and the host of heaven worshippeth thee. 
 
PSALM 8:3 
3        When I consider thy heavens, the work of thy fingers, the 
moon and the stars, which thou hast ordained; 
 
PSALM 8:4 
4    What is man, that thou art mindful of him? and the son of 
man, that thou visitest him? 
 
PSALM 19:1 
1        To the chief Musician, A Psalm of David.   The heavens 
declare the glory of God; and the firmament sheweth his 
handywork. 
 
PSALM 19:2 
2    Day unto day uttereth speech, and night unto night sheweth 
knowledge. 
 

PSALM 19:3 
3    There is no speech nor language, where their voice is not 
heard. 
 
PSALM 19:4 
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4    Their line is gone out through all the earth, and their words to 

the end of the world.   In them hath he set a tabernacle for the 
sun, 
 
PSALM 33:6 
6    By the word of the LORD were the heavens made; and all the 
host of them by the breath of his mouth. 
 
PSALM 68:33 
33    To him that rideth upon the heavens of heavens, which were 
of old; lo, he doth send out his voice, and that a mighty voice. 
 
PSALM 89:5 
5        And the heavens shall praise thy wonders, O LORD: thy 
faithfulness also in the congregation of the saints. 
 
PSALM 96:11 
11    Let the heavens rejoice, and let the earth be glad; let the 
sea roar, and the fulness thereof. 
 
PSALM 96:12 
12    Let the field be joyful, and all that is therein: then shall all 
the trees of the wood rejoice 
 
PSALM 97:6 
6    The heavens declare his righteousness, and all the people see 
his glory. 
 
PSALM 115:16 
16    The heaven, even the heavens, are the LORD'S: but the 
earth hath he given to the children of men. 

 
ISAIAH 44:23 
23    Sing, O ye heavens; for the LORD hath done it: shout, ye 
lower parts of the earth: break forth into singing, ye mountains, 
O forest, and every tree therein: for the LORD hath redeemed 
Jacob, and glorified himself in Israel. 
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ISAIAH 44:24 

24    Thus saith the LORD, thy redeemer, and he that formed 
thee from the womb, I am the LORD that maketh all things; that 
stretcheth forth the heavens alone; that spreadeth abroad the 
earth by myself; 
 
ISAIAH 49:13 
13        Sing, O heavens; and be joyful, O earth; and break forth 
into singing, O mountains: for the LORD hath comforted his 
people, and will have mercy upon his afflicted. 
 
JEREMIAH 31:35 
35        Thus saith the LORD, which giveth the sun for a light by 
day, and the ordinances of the moon and of the stars for a light 
by night, which divideth the sea when the waves thereof roar; 
The LORD of hosts is his name: 
 
JEREMIAH 31:36 
36    If those ordinances depart from before me, saith the LORD, 
then the seed of Israel also shall cease from being a nation before 
me for ever. 
 
JEREMIAH 31:37 
37    Thus saith the LORD; If heaven above can be measured, 
and the foundations of the earth searched out beneath, I will also 
cast off all the seed of Israel for all that they have done, saith the 
LORD. 
 
HEBREWS 1:10 
10    And, Thou, Lord, in the beginning hast laid the foundation of 
the earth; and the heavens are the works of thine hands: 

 
There are an estimated 70 sextillion stars in the known universe  
 
(70,000,000,000,000,000,000,000) 
 

http://www.rmg.co.uk/explore/astronomy-and-time/astronomy-facts/faqs/what-is-a-galaxy-how-many-stars-in-a-galaxy-how-many-stars/galaxies-in-the-universe


8 
 

Astronomy is the study of the sun, moon, stars, planets, comets, 

gas, galaxies, gas, dust and other non-Earthly bodies and 
phenomena. 
 
 
astrology is not a science and is no longer recognized as having 
anything to do with astronomy. 
 
 
ASTROLOGY 
the divination of the supposed influences of the stars and planets 
on human affairs and terrestrial events by their positions and 
aspects 
 
 
GENESIS 1:16 
16    And God made two great lights; the greater light to rule the 
day, and the lesser light to rule the night: he made the stars also. 
 
GENESIS 1:17 
17    And God set them in the firmament of the heaven to give 
light upon the earth, 
 
GENESIS 1:18 
18    And to rule over the day and over the night, and to divide 
the light from the darkness: and God saw that it was good. 
 
GENESIS 15:5 
5    And he brought him forth abroad, and said, Look now toward 
heaven, and tell the stars, if thou be able to number them: and 
he said unto him, So shall thy seed be. 

 
GENESIS 22:17 
17    That in blessing I will bless thee, and in multiplying I will 
multiply thy seed as the stars of the heaven, and as the sand 
which is upon the sea shore; and thy seed shall possess the gate 
of his enemies; 
 

https://www.livescience.com/4667-astrological-sign.html
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GENESIS 37:9 

9    And he dreamed yet another dream, and told it his brethren, 
and said, Behold, I have dreamed a dream more; and, behold, 
the sun and the moon and the eleven stars made obeisance to 
me. 
 
JUDGES 5:19 
19    The kings came and fought, then fought the kings of Canaan 
in Taanach by the waters of Megiddo; they took no gain of 
money. 
 
JUDGES 5:20 
20    They fought from heaven; the stars in their courses fought 
against Sisera. 
 
Josephus relates that, just as the battle began, a violent tempest 
came on with a great downfall of rain; and a hailstorm, which,  
 
driving full in the faces of the Canaanites, so blinded and 
benumbed them with cold, that they could neither use their bows 
with effect nor even hold their swords. 
 
PSALM 8:3 
3        When I consider thy heavens, the work of thy fingers, the 
moon and the stars, which thou hast ordained; 
 
PSALM 136:6 
6    To him that stretched out the earth above the waters: for his 
mercy endureth for ever. 
 
PSALM 136:7 

7    To him that made great lights: for his mercy endureth for 
ever: 
 
PSALM 136:8 
8    The sun to rule by day: for his mercy endureth for ever: 
 
PSALM 136:9 
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9    The moon and stars to rule by night: for his mercy endureth 

for ever. 
 
PSALM 148:3 
3    Praise ye him, sun and moon: praise him, all ye stars of light. 
 
PSALM 148:4 
4    Praise him, ye heavens of heavens, and ye waters that be 
above the heavens. 
 
PSALM 148:5 
5    Let them praise the name of the LORD: for he commanded, 
and they were created. 
 
ISAIAH 14:13 
13    For thou hast said in thine heart, I will ascend into heaven, I 
will exalt my throne above the stars of God: I will sit also upon 
the mount of the congregation, in the sides of the north: 
 
JEREMIAH 31:35 
35        Thus saith the LORD, which giveth the sun for a light by 
day, and the ordinances of the moon and of the stars for a light 
by night, which divideth the sea when the waves thereof roar; 
The LORD of hosts is his name: 
 
DANIEL 12:3 
3    And they that be wise shall shine as the brightness of the 
firmament; and they that turn many to righteousness as the stars 
for ever and ever. 
 
AMOS 5:8 

8    Seek him that maketh the seven stars and Orion, and turneth 
the shadow of death into the morning, and maketh the day dark 
with night: that calleth for the waters of the sea, and poureth 
them out upon the face of the earth: The LORD is his name: 
 
JUDE 1:13 
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13    Raging waves of the sea, foaming out their own shame; 

wandering stars, to whom is reserved the blackness of darkness 
for ever. 
 
REVELATION 1:16 
16    And he had in his right hand seven stars: and out of his 
mouth went a sharp twoedged sword: and his countenance was 
as the sun shineth in his strength. 
 
REVELATION 1:20 
20    The mystery of the seven stars which thou sawest in my 
right hand, and the seven golden candlesticks.   The seven stars 
are the angels of the seven churches: and the seven candlesticks 
which thou sawest are the seven churches. 
 
REVELATION 2:1 
1        Unto the angel of the church of Ephesus write; These 
things saith he that holdeth the seven stars in his right hand, who 
walketh in the midst of the seven golden candlesticks; 
 
REVELATION 3:1 
1        And unto the angel of the church in Sardis write; These 
things saith he that hath the seven Spirits of God, and the seven 
stars; I know thy works, that thou hast a name that thou livest, 
and art dead. 
 
REVELATION 12:1 
1        And there appeared a great wonder in heaven; a woman 
clothed with the sun, and the moon under her feet, and upon her 
head a crown of twelve stars: 
 

REVELATION 12:4 
4    And his tail drew the third part of the stars of heaven, and did 
cast them to the earth: and the dragon stood before the woman 
which was ready to be delivered, for to devour her child as soon 
as it was born. 
 
JOB 38:31 
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31    Canst thou bind the sweet influences of Pleiades, or loose 

the bands of Orion? 
 
AMOS 5:8 
8    Seek him that maketh the seven stars and Orion, and turneth 
the shadow of death into the morning, and maketh the day dark 
with night: that calleth for the waters of the sea, and poureth 
them out upon the face of the earth: The LORD is his name: 
 
JOB 38:31 
31    Canst thou bind the sweet influences of Pleiades, or loose 
the bands of Orion? 
 
JOB 9:7 
7    Which commandeth the sun, and it riseth not; and sealeth up 
the stars. 
 
JOB 9:8 
8    Which alone spreadeth out the heavens, and treadeth upon 
the waves of the sea. 
 
JOB 9:9 
9    Which maketh Arcturus, Orion, and Pleiades, and the 
chambers of the south. 
 
JOB 9:10 
10    Which doeth great things past finding out; yea, and wonders 
without number. 
 
JOB 38:31 
31    Canst thou bind the sweet influences of Pleiades, or loose 

the bands of Orion? 


