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GETTING IN THE SPIRIT 90 
 
REVELATION 19:6 
     6    And I heard as it were the voice of a great multitude, and 
as the voice of many waters, and as the voice of mighty 
thunderings, saying, Alleluia: for the Lord God omnipotent 
reigneth.  
 
REVELATION 19:7 
     7    Let us be glad and rejoice, and give honour to him: for 

the marriage of the Lamb is come, and his wife hath made herself 
ready.  
 
REVELATION 19:8 
     8    And to her was granted that she should be arrayed in fine 
linen, clean and white: for the fine linen is the righteousness of 
saints. 
 
REVELATION 19:7 
     7    Let us be glad and rejoice, and give honour to him: for 
the *MARRIAGE of the Lamb is come, and his wife hath made 
herself ready.  
 
MARRIAGE: GREEK LEXICON -- STRONG'S NUMBER 1062 
gamos    {gam'-os}     
a wedding or marriage festival, a wedding banquet, a wedding 
feast 
 
REVELATION 19:8 
     8    And to her was granted that she should be arrayed in fine 
linen, clean and white: for the fine linen is the righteousness of 

saints.  
 
REVELATION 3:4 
     4    Thou hast a few names even in Sardis which have not 
defiled their garments; and they shall walk with me in white: for 
they are worthy. 
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PHILIPPIANS 3:9 
     9     ¶  And be found in him, not having mine own 
righteousness, which is of the law, but that which is through the 
faith of Christ, the righteousness which is of God by faith: 
 
REVELATION 19:9 
     9    And he saith unto me, Write, Blessed are they which are 
called unto the marriage supper of the Lamb. And he saith unto 
me, These are the true sayings of God.  
 

REVELATION 19:10 
     10    And I fell at his feet to worship him. And he said unto 
me, See thou do it not: I am thy fellowservant, and of thy 
brethren that have the testimony of Jesus: worship God: for the 
testimony of Jesus is the spirit of prophecy.  
 
REVELATION 22:8 
     8    And I John saw these things, and heard them. And when I 
had heard and seen, I fell down to worship before the feet of the 
angel which shewed me these things.  
 
REVELATION 22:9 
     9    Then saith he unto me, See thou do it not: for I am thy 
fellowservant, and of thy brethren the prophets, and of them 
which keep the sayings of this book: worship God. 
 
REVELATION 19:10 
     10    And I fell at his feet to worship him. And he said unto 
me, See thou do it not: I am thy fellowservant, and of thy 
brethren that have the testimony of Jesus: worship God: for the 
testimony of Jesus is the spirit of prophecy.  

 
REVELATION 19:11 
     11     ¶  And I saw heaven opened, and behold a white horse; 
and he that sat upon him was called Faithful and True, and in 
righteousness he doth judge and make war.  
 
REVELATION 19:12 
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     12    His eyes were as a flame of fire, and on his head were 
many crowns; and he had a name written, that no man knew, but 
he himself.  
 
REVELATION 19:13 
     13    And he was clothed with a vesture dipped in blood: and 
his name is called The Word of God.  
 
  48-1    PATMOS.VISION  -  CHURCH.AGE.BOOK CPT.2 
…….Today is certainly not the Lord's Day. 

This is man's day. It is man's doing, man's work, man's church, 
man's idea of worship, man's everything, for it is man's world 
(cosmos). BUT THE DAY OF THE LORD IS COMING. Yes, it is. 
It is just that at this time of the Revelation of Jesus Christ, John 
was taken up by the Spirit and transported by the Spirit to that 
Great Day that is coming. The Lord's Day is when the days of 
man are over. The kingdoms of this world will then become the 
kingdoms of our God. The day of the Lord is when the 
judgments fall, and after that comes the millennium. Right 
now the world does what it wants to do with the Christian. They 
call him all manner of evil names, making fun of him. But there is 
coming that great and notable day when they will wail and howl, 
for the Lamb is coming in wrath to judge the world. That is when 
the righteous will have their day with the Lord, for the wicked 
shall burn and the righteous will walk over their ashes into the 
millennium. 
Malachi 4:3, 
 "And ye shall tread down the wicked for they shall be ashes 
under the soles of your feet in the day that I shall do this, saith 
the Lord of hosts." 
 

ISAIAH 13:6 
     6     ¶  Howl ye; for the day of the LORD is at hand; it shall 
come as a destruction from the Almighty. 
 
ISAIAH 13:9 
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     9    Behold, the day of the LORD cometh, cruel both with 
wrath and fierce anger, to lay the land desolate: and he shall 
destroy the sinners thereof out of it. 
 
ISAIAH 13:10 
     10    For the stars of heaven and the constellations thereof 
shall not give their light: the sun shall be darkened in his going 
forth, and the moon shall not cause her light to shine. 
 
ISAIAH 13:11 

     11    And I will punish the world for their evil, and the wicked 
for their iniquity; and I will cause the arrogancy of the proud to 
cease, and will lay low the haughtiness of the terrible. 
 
ISAIAH 13:12 
     12    I will make a man more precious than fine gold; even a 
man than the golden wedge of Ophir. 
 
ISAIAH 13:13 
     13    Therefore I will shake the heavens, and the earth shall 
remove out of her place, in the wrath of the LORD of hosts, and 
in the day of his fierce anger. 
 
ISAIAH 63:1 
     1     ¶  Who is this that cometh from Edom, with dyed 
garments from Bozrah? this that is glorious in his apparel, 
travelling in the greatness of his strength? I that speak in 
righteousness, mighty to save. 
 
ISAIAH 63:2 
     2    Wherefore art thou red in thine apparel, and thy garments 

like him that treadeth in the winefat? 
 
ISAIAH 63:3 
     3    I have trodden the winepress alone; and of the people 
there was none with me: for I will tread them in mine anger, and 
trample them in my fury; and their blood shall be sprinkled upon 
my garments, and I will stain all my raiment. 
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ISAIAH 63:4 
     4    For the day of vengeance is in mine heart, and the year of 
my redeemed is come. 
 
ISAIAH 63:6 
     6    And I will tread down the people in mine anger, and make 
them drunk in my fury, and I will bring down their strength to the 
earth. 
 

JEREMIAH 10:10 
     10    But the LORD is the true God, he is the living God, and 
an everlasting king: at his wrath the earth shall tremble, and the 
nations shall not be able to abide his indignation. 
 
JOEL 1:15 
     15    Alas for the day! for the day of the LORD is at hand, 
and as a destruction from the Almighty shall it come. 
 
JOEL 2:1 
     1     ¶  Blow ye the trumpet in Zion, and sound an alarm in 
my holy mountain: let all the inhabitants of the land tremble: for 
the day of the LORD cometh, for it is nigh at hand; 
 
JOEL 2:2 
     2    A day of darkness and of gloominess, a day of clouds and 
of thick darkness, as the morning spread upon the mountains: a 
great people and a strong; there hath not been ever the like, 
neither shall be any more after it, even to the years of many 
generations. 
 

JOEL 2:11 
     11    And the LORD shall utter his voice before his army: for 
his camp is very great: for he is strong that executeth his word: 
for the day of the LORD is great and very terrible; and who 
can abide it? 
 
OBADIAH 1:15 
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     15    For the day of the LORD is near upon all the heathen: as 
thou hast done, it shall be done unto thee: thy reward shall 
return upon thine own head. 
 
OBADIAH 1:16 
     16    For as ye have drunk upon my holy mountain, so shall all 
the heathen drink continually, yea, they shall drink, and they 
shall swallow down, and they shall be as though they had not 
been. 
 

OBADIAH 1:17 
     17     ¶  But upon mount Zion shall be deliverance, and there 
shall be holiness; and the house of Jacob shall possess their 
possessions. 
 
ZEPHANIAH 1:14 
     14     ¶  The great day of the LORD is near, it is near, and 
hasteth greatly, even the voice of the day of the LORD: the 
mighty man shall cry there bitterly. 
 
ZEPHANIAH 1:15 
     15    That day is a day of wrath, a day of trouble and distress, 
a day of wasteness and desolation, a day of darkness and 
gloominess, a day of clouds and thick darkness, 
 
II PETER 3:10 
     10    But the day of the Lord will come as a thief in the night; 
in the which the heavens shall pass away with a great noise, and 
the elements shall melt with fervent heat, the earth also and the 
works that are therein shall be burned up. 
 

REVELATION 19:13 
     13    And he was clothed with a vesture dipped in blood: and 
his name is called The Word of God.  
 
REVELATION 19:14 
     14    And the armies which were in heaven followed him upon 
white horses, clothed in fine linen, white and clean. 
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REVELATION 19:15 
     15    And out of his mouth goeth a sharp sword, that with it 
he should smite the nations: and he shall rule them with a rod of 
iron: and he treadeth the winepress of the fierceness and wrath 
of Almighty God.  
 
PSALM 2:8 
     8    Ask of me, and I shall give thee the heathen for thine 
inheritance, and the uttermost parts of the earth for thy 

possession. 
 
PSALM 2:9 
     9    Thou shalt break them with a rod of iron; thou shalt dash 
them in pieces like a potter's vessel. 
 
ISAIAH 11:4 
     4    But with righteousness shall he judge the poor, and 
reprove with equity for the meek of the earth: and he shall smite 
the earth with the rod of his mouth, and with the breath of his 
lips shall he slay the wicked. 
 
REVELATION 19:15 
     15    And out of his mouth goeth a sharp sword, that with it 
he should smite the nations: and he shall rule them with a rod of 
iron: and he treadeth the winepress of the fierceness and wrath 
of Almighty God.  
 
REVELATION 19:16 
     16    And he hath on his vesture and on his thigh a name 
written, KING OF KINGS, AND LORD OF LORDS.  


